
WOOD EFFECT

WATER RESISTANT MODULAR DESIGN

EASY FIT

Panel size:
2.9m x 121.5mm x 12.5mm

Create a unique space in your home or business 
with the Slat Legends PVC Wall panels. Suitable 
for any room, and specifically well suited to 
high moisture areas due to it’s water resistant 
properties.

Combined with the smooth wipe-able surface of 
the panels, these are perfect for upgrading the 
interiors of your bathrooms, kitchens or utility 
rooms.
 
With 6 striking finishes to choose from you can 
create a nature inspired feature wall or ceiling, 
bringing a warm and inviting finish to any room.

Slat Legends Wall Panels have natural, wood like 
features through all the colour options, offering a 
truely unique effect for any room in your home or 
business.

Featuring a modular design and sleek, colour 
matched trims, these panels offer a seamless 
finish with an effortless installation. Add some 
character to your interiors with minimal effort but 
maximum impact.

GREY

NATURAL

WALNUT

ANTHRACITE

ANTIQUE

ASH

IDEAL FOR

BATHROOMS

depth & drama 
for your bathrooms, washrooms, kitchens, uti l i ty rooms & more!

Samples

Available ANTHRACITEASH

N.B. Product colours shown may vary slightly from the physical product.



GREY

NATURAL ASH

WALNUT

DARK GREY

BLACK OAK

SMOKED WALNUT

The ultimate way to add a feature wall or 
dramatic ceiling effect to your interior with
the added bonus of reducing noise levels!

Slat Legends Ultra wall panels, made from MDF 
with a wood veneer finish, help to reduce sound 
levels and reverberation within busier areas of the 
home or business by the addition of a subtle black 
felt liner.

Upon installation, the felt lining on the rear of 
the wall panels offers an immediate acoustic 
improvement without the need for a separate 
sound proofing product to be installed.

WOOD EFFECTLIGHTWEIGHT

MODULAR DESIGN

Ranging from sophisticated Black Oak to scandi 
style Natural Ash, you can create a nature inspired 
feature wall or ceiling to suit any room.

With their simple modular design, this allows for 
an effortless installation so you can create a fresh 
and calming environment with minimal effort or 
equipment required.

EASY FIT

noise reducing

Panel size:
2.4m x 600mm x 21mm

ACOUSTIC

BENEFITS

Samples

Available NATURAL ASHBLACK OAK

N.B. Product colours shown may vary slightly from the physical product.


